STATE OF RHODE ISLAND PROVIDENCE, SC.

SUPERIOR COURT

In Re: William J. Conley, Jr., Attorney at Law

C.A. No.: 13-3686

ORDER

This matter was heard on the Motion Calendar in Providence County Superior Court on Wednesday, May 7, 2013 on the State of Rhode Island's Motion for Approval of Attorney's Fees. After hearing and due consideration by this Honorable Court, it is hereby:

ORDERED, ADJUDGED AND DECREED:

Pursuant to Rhode Island General Laws § 9-31-11, this Honorable Court finds the fees of William J. Conley, Jr., Esquire in the amount of Forty Two Thousand Four Hundred Eighty Five and 00/100 (\$42,485.00) Dollars to be reasonable, and, therefore, grant the Motion for Approval of Attorney's Fees.

ENTERED:

Justice-Jeffrey A. Lanphear

Procaccini

Respectfully submitted, STATE OF RHODE ISLAND

By its Attorney, PETER F. KILMARTIN ATTORNEY GENERAL

Maria R. Corvese, Bar No. 8558 Special Assistant Attorney General

150 South Main Street

Providence, Rhode Island 02903

(401) 274-4400, Extension 2225

Fax No. (401) 222-3016 mcorvese@riag.ri.gov

CARY SIX HOW IN OLE.

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, the undersigned, hereby certify that a copy of the foregoing Motion for Approval of Attorney Fees was mailed, postage prepaid, on this the day of August 2013, to the following:

William J. Conley, Jr., Esquire Law Office of William J. Conley, Jr. 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, Rhode Island 02915

Maria R. Corvese

DATE OF HEARING: Wednesday, August 7, 2013

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND PROVIDENCE, SC.

SUPERIOR COURT

In Re: William J. Conley, Jr., Attorney at Law

C.A. No.: 13-3686

MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF ATTORNEY FEES PURSUANT TO RHODE ISLAND GENERAL LAWS § 9-31-11

WHEREAS, the Department of Justice ("DOJ") has initiated an investigation into whether the State of Rhode Island ("State") violated Title II of the Americans with Disabilities Act ("ADA"), 42 U.S. § 12132 and Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act ("Section 504"), 29 U.S.C. § 794(a), as interpreted by the Supreme Court's decision in Olmstead v. L.C., 527 U.S. 581 (1999).

WHEREAS, pursuant to R.I. Gen. Laws § 9-31-11, the Attorney General determined that there was a conflict of interest, and that it was not in the best interest of the State of Rhode Island for the Department of Attorney General to represent the State in this matter.

WHEREAS, pursuant to R.I. Gen. Laws § 9-31-11, the State was advised of the determination of the Department of Attorney General and William J. Conley, Jr., Esquire was retained to represent the State;

WHEREAS, pursuant to R.I. Gen. Laws § 9-31-11, the Attorney General had consulted in advance with the prospective counsel to establish the parameters within which the State would be liable for attorney fees, a copy of which is attached hereto as Exhibit A;

WHEREAS, R.I. Gen. Laws § 9-31-11 requires that the reasonableness of the attorney fees be approved by this Court.

7-24 KH WHEREAS, James R. Lee, Chief of the Civil Division of the Rhode Island Department of Attorney General, has reviewed the bills listed below and has determined that the services rendered were reasonably performed in accordance with the parameters set forth in Exhibit A.

See Exhibit B, Affidavit of James R. Lee.

Now, therefore, your petitioner requests that this Court review and approve the following exhibits, which consist of Attorney Conley's bills totaling Forty Two Thousand Four Hundred Eighty Five Dollars (\$42,485.00), for the purpose of determining the attorney fees to be reasonable:

- a. Exhibit C, Invoice dated February 1, 2013 in the amount of Four Hundred Fifty Dollars (\$450.00);
- b. Exhibit D, Invoice dated March 1, 2013 in the amount of Three Thousand Eight Hundred Sixty Two Dollars and Fifty Cents (\$3,862.50);
- c. <u>Exhibit E</u>, Invoice dated April 3, 2013 in the amount of Six Thousand Five Hundred Seventy Two Dollars and Fifty Cents (\$6,572.50);
- d. Exhibit F, Invoice dated May 1, 2013 in the amount of Two Thousand Five Hundred Sixty Seven Dollars and Fifty Cents (\$2,567.50);
- e. Exhibit G, Invoice dated June 5, 2013 in the amount of Fourteen Thousand One Hundred Thirty Two and Fifty Cents (\$14, 132.50);
- f. Exhibit H, Invoice dated July 3, 2013 in the amount of Fourteen Thousand Nine Hundred (\$14,900.00).

Respectfully submitted,

State of Rhode Island

By its Attomey, PETER F. KILMARTIN ATTORNEY GENERAL

Maria R. Cowese, Bar No. 8558
Special Assistant Attorney General
150 South Main Street
Providence, Rhode Island 02903
(401) 274-4400, Extension 2225
Fax No. (401) 222-3016
mcorvese@riag.ri.gov

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, the undersigned, hereby certify that a copy of the foregoing Motion for Approval of Attorney Fees was mailed, postage prepaid, on this 24th day of July 2013, to the following:

William J. Conley, Jr., Esquire Law Office of William J. Conley, Jr. 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, Rhode Island 02915

EXHIBIT A



State of Rhode Island and Providence Plantations

DEPARTMENT OF ATTORNEY GENERAL

150 South Main Street • Providence, RI 02903 (401) 274-4400 - TDD (401) 453-0410

Peter F. Kilmartin, Attorney General

January 23, 2013

Carlo Carlos Carlos

William Conley, Esq. 670 Willett Ave. East Providence, RI 02915

Re: U.S. D.O.J, et al. v. Rhode Island (OHHS, et al)

Dear Bill:

There has been a determination made by this office that it is in the best interest of the State of Rhode Island to have outside counsel represent the State in the above referenced proceeding. We wish to retain you as counsel in this matter within the following parameters, as contemplated by R.I. Gen. Laws § 9-31-11, which are hereby agreed upon by the State of Rhode Island:

- 1. Work performed by you will be paid by the State at the rate of \$150.00 per hour.
- 2. You will provide this office with itemized statements including date, service performed and time spent for services rendered which will be paid, provided that their reasonableness is first reviewed and approved by this office and the Court.

If the foregoing is acceptable, please indicate your acceptance by signing and returning to me the duplicate of this letter.

/James R. Leè

'Assistant Attorney General

JRL/

Accepted 1

William Conley Foo

EXHIBIT B

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND PROVIDENCE, SC.

SUPERIOR COURT

In Re: William J. Conley, Jr. Attorney at Law

C.A.	NO.	

AFFIDAVIT OF JAMES R. LEE

I, James R. Lee, first being duly sworn according to the laws of the State of Rhode Island, do hereby depose and state:

- 1. I am the Chief of the Civil Division of the Rhode Island Department of the Attorney General. I file this Affidavit in supplement to the Motion for Approval of Attorney Fees filed herein.
- 2. Based upon my familiarity with the rates charged by law firms for civil litigation in the State of Rhode Island, it is my opinion that the rate of \$150.00 per hour is fair and reasonable and not in excess of the prevailing rates in the community for time spent in civil litigation of this nature by attorneys with similar experience.
- 3. I have reviewed the following attached bills and find them to be a fair and reasonable representation of services rendered. The services rendered below were reasonably performed in accordance with the agreement entered into with this Department:
- a. Invoice dated February 1, 2013 for services rendered January 26, 2013 through January 28, 2013.
- b. Invoice dated March 1, 2013 for services rendered February 1, 2013 through February 28, 2013.
- c. Invoice dated April 3, 2013 for services rendered February 27, 2013 through March 29, 2013.
- d. Invoice dated May 1, 2013 for services rendered March 28, 2013 through April 26, 2013.

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND PROVIDENCE, SC.

SUPERIOR COURT

In Re: William J. Conley, Jr. Attorney at Law C.A. NO. _____

e. Invoice dated June 5, 2013 for services rendered April 22, 2013 through May 31, 2013.

f. Invoice dated July 3, 2013 for services rendered May 28, 2013 through June 28, 2013.

The State requests permission to pay the sum of Forty Two Thousand Four Hundred Eighty-Five and 00/100 (\$42,485.00) Dollars.

James R. Lee

Chief, Civil Division

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND COUNTY OF PROVIDENCE

Subscribed and sworn to before me on this 22nd day of July 2013

Notary Public

My Commission Expires:

EXHIBIT C

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

BILL TO State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
2/1/2013	A 149

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
1/26/2013	150	WJC Attention to e-mail from Attorney General Jim Lee and documents, 1/14/13 US Department of Justice correspondence and 1/14/13 US Department of Labor correspondence, attention to relevant federal statutes, regulations and case law re: the Americans with Disabilities Act and FLSA	2.8	420.00
1/28/2013 1/28/2013	150 150	WJC Phone call with Jane Morgan WJC Attention to Department of Justice Grand Jury Subpoena to Craig Stenning Department of Behavioral Health Developmental Disabilities and Hospitals	0.1 0.1	15.00 15.00
		Please note this billing is for January 2013. Due to a software error, we are late in billing and apologize for any inconvenience.		

REGARDING
US Department of

Justice Title II Investigation

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

\$450.00

\$0.00

\$450.00

EXHIBIT D

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

Invoice

Date	invoice#
3/1/2013	A 115

Bill To	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St.	
Providence, RI 02903	
	·

P.O. No.	Terms	Project
		OHHS

Quantity	Description	Rate	Amount
0.1	2/1/13 William J Conley Jr	150.00	15.00
***	Telephone conference with Dept. of Justice Attorney Regina Kline		
1.5	2/1/13 Dylan Conley	150.00	225.00
	Attention to file, Research re: comparable law suits	150.00	75.00
0.5	2/3/13 William J Conley Jr Further review of relevant statute regulations and requested information	150.00	75.00
0.1	2/4/13 William J Conley Jr	150.00	15.00
0.1	Attention to e-mails from Jane Morgan and John Capobianco	1	
0.2	2/4/13 William J Conley Jr	150.00	30.00
•	Telephone conference with Jane Morgan re marshaling of requested documents and		
	related issues	150.00	15.00
0.1	2/4/13 William J Conley Jr Further telephone conference with Jane Morgan re document request from US Dept. of	130.00	15.00
	Justice and subpoena	•	
2	2/5/13 William J Conley Jr	150.00	300.00
	Attention to statute regulations re enforcement procedures and standards		
1.75	2/5/13 William J Conley Jr	150.00	262.50
	Conference with Jane Morgan, Craig Stenning, and Diane Leyden	150.00	15.00
0.1	2/3/13 William J Conley Jr Attention to e-mails from Jane Morgan re TTP / records and document retrieval	150.00	15.00
0.1	2/6/13 William J Conley Jr	150.00	15.00
٠.,	Telephone conference with Dept. of Justice Attorney Regina Kline		
4	2/6/13 Dylan Conley	150.00	600.00
	Research re: other comparable law suits, attention to file, attention to correspondences,	1	
	background research	150.00	450.00
3	2/7/13 William J Conley Jr Attention to e-mails with Jane Morgan, Director, etc. re DD Leadership Council / TTP	150.00	450.00
	licensing issues; atm. to and review research materials re Employment First		
1.5	2/7/13 Dylan Conley	150.00	225.00
	Research re: other comparable law suits, attention to file, attention to correspondences,	1	
	background research		
	<u></u>	1	
		Total	

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

Invoice

Date	Invoice #
3/1/2013	A 115

Project

Bill To	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

					OHHS
Quantity	Description		Rate	7	Amount
0.5 2	2/8/13 William J Conley Jr	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,		150.00	75.00
17	Telephone conference with Secretary Costantino / Jacquel				
	with Jane Morgan re Dept. of Justice document request; a	tn. to e-mail with Jacqu	eline		
	Kelley re RI Legislature document request				
	2/8/13 William J Conley Jr	*		150.00	90.0
	Telephone conference with Jane Morgan and Diane Leyde Attorney Regina Kline from Dept. of Justice	n and attn. to e-mail wi	™		
	Attorney Regina Rine from Dept. of Justice 2/10/13 William J Conley Jr			150.00	375.0
	Legal research re Dept. of Justice enforcement actions in o	other states. Consent Or	B	250.00	575,0
	and Judgments entered in other states	one blace, comen or	*****		
L .	2/12/13 William J Conley Jr			150.00	15.0
	Felephone conference with Jane Morgan re document retr	ieval status		i	
2 2	2/13/13 William J Conley Jr		1	150.00	300.0
(Conference with Jane Morgan, review documents respons	ive to Dept. of Justice			
	request; telephone message re status to Dept. of Justice At	torney Kline; attn. to dr	raft		
	Employment First Policy documents from Jane Morgan				
	2/14/13 William J Conley Jr			150.00	45.0
	Attn. to project sustainability documents 2/14/13 William J Conley Jr			150.00	525.0
3.3 [2	Attendance at OHHS meeting with Dept. of Justice			130.00	323.0
	2/15/13 William J Conley Jr	1		150.00	45.00
	Attn. to e-mails from Jane Morgan, Sean Fontes, and Fred	Stoli: attn. to			10.0
	correspondence re TTP with Interim Executive Director	,		1	
	2/24/13 William J Conley Jr			150.00	105.0
Į.	Attn. to e-mails and documents from Jane Morgan/Diane l	Leyden (Agreement bety	ween	1	
	OHHS agencies); HR Policy			ł	
0.1 2	2/28/13 William J Conley Jr			150.00	15.00
	Attn. to e-mails with Jane Morgan re Employment First		}		
	2/28/13 William J Conley Jr	Walian &aaaaaaa		150.00	15.00
	Attn. to e-mails with Craig Stenning re Employment First 2/28/13 William J Conley Jr	roncy for new participa		150.00	15.00
	Attn. to e-mail with Mary Madden/Jane Morgan		1	130.00	15.00
	Truit to Omen with trially triaddempanie triot Ben				
			Total		\$3,862.50

P.O. No.

Tems

EXHIBIT E

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
4/3/2013	A 169

BILL TO	
State of RI	
Department of Attorney General	
150 South Main St.	
Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
2/27/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research re: FedCap, history, applicability to DOJ standards, capacity for TTP's DD individuals; Attention to file, research re: case history, research re: state organization of pertinent department's, DOJ's view of similar state organizations and frameworks; analysis of press re: legal developments across the country	2.5	250.00
2/28/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research re: FedCap, history, applicability to DOJ standards, capacity for TTP's DD individuals; Attention to file, research re: case history, research re: state organization of pertinent department's, DOJ's view of similar state organizations and frameworks; analysis of press re: legal developments across the country	4.5	450.00
3/2/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research re: FedCap, history, applicability to DOJ standards, capacity for TTP's DD individuals; Attention to file, research re: case history, research re: state organization of pertinent department's, DOJ's view of similar state organizations and frameworks; analysis of press re: legal developments across the country	1	100.00
3/3/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mails/documents - HR Policy/Personnel Rules and Regulations and statute/RI Executive Office of Health and Human Services Cooperative Data Sharing Agt.	1.5	225.00

Total
Payments/Credits
Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
4/3/2013	A 169

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of	
Justice Title II Investigation	
	•

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
3/3/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research re: FedCap, history, applicability to DOJ standards, capacity for TTP's DD individuals; Attention to file, research re: case history, research re: state organization of pertinent department's, DOJ's view of similar state organizations and frameworks; analysis of press re: legal developments across the country	3	300.00
3/4/2013	Legal Services	, , ,	0.1	15.00
3/4/2013	Paralegal Ser		3.5	350.00
3/5/2013	Legal Services	1	3	450.00
3/5/2013	Legal Services		1	150.00
3/5/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC research - Olmstead standard, other comparable states provisions, SCOTUS opinions, DOJ findings, Case History	1	100.00

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Total

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
4/3/2013	A 169

BILL TO
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
3/6/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to legal memo with Attorney Morgan re DOJ request for action and documents; attn. to documents information re FEDCAP	0.75	112.50
3/6/2013	Legal Services	l I	0.25	37.50
3/6/2013	Legal Services	1	1.4	210.00
3/6/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to review State of Georgia review of supported employment services under US v. Georgia Settlement Agt. and findings from the state health authority yardstick; report of independent reviewer; Georgia employment training and tech assistance documents		450.00
3/6/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Attention to file, research re: Grand Jury Subpoena, Correspondence with D Leyden, Teleconference with D Leyden, research re: DOJ and DOL's perspective as to the bottom line issue	0.7	70.00
3/7/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to correspondence from Attorney Kline from the US DOJ	0.1	15.00
3/7/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with RIDE Attorney George Muksian	0.2	30.00
3/7/2013		WJC Review correspondence from BHDDH to TTP management letter	0.2	30.00
3/7/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mail documents re TTP amended conditional license stipulations	0.3	45.00

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO,
4/3/2013	A 169

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of	
Justice Title II Investigation	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
3/7/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC research - Olmstead standard, other comparable states provisions, SCOTUS opinions, DOJ findings, Case History	2.7	270.00
3/7/2013	Paralegal Ser		0.5	50.00
3/8/2013	Legal Services		0.1	15.00
3/8/2013	Legal Services	WIC Attn. to Federal subpoena Fogarty Center and Laplante	0.1	15.00
3/8/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attendance at meeting BHDDH, TTP, FEDCAP	3	450.00
3/8/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mails from Attorney Morgan, Anthony Antosh re DOJ document request	0.1	15.00
3/8/2013	Legal Services	WJC Review of state enforcement actions under Title II with other states by the DOJ	0.8	120.00
3/8/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC research - Olmstead standard, other comparable states provisions, SCOTUS opinions, DOJ findings, Case History	2.1	210.00
3/8/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Attention to file, research re: Grand Jury Subpoena, Correspondence with D Leyden, Teleconference with D Leyden, research re: DOJ and DOL's perspective as to the bottom line issue	2.	200.00
	,			

Total
Payments/Credits
Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
4/3/2013	A 169

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
3/10/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC research - Olmstead standard, other comparable states provisions, SCOTUS opinions, DOJ findings, Case History	1.3	130.00
3/12/2013	Legal Services	WIC Attn. to e-mails from Attorney Jane Morgan, D. Sanborn of FedCap and attn. to file re same	0.2	30.00
3/13/2013	Legal Services	WJC Conf. with Jane Morgan, Director Stenning, Dianne Leyden	1	150.00
3/13/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBCFile research, coordination of document exchange and facilitation of FedCap's take over of TTP; Phone calls Special Agent, DOL; DOJ; FedCap; BHDDH	0.8	80.00
3/14/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Leyden re TTP management issues, FedCap, Grand Jury Subpoena, docs. compliance status	0.25	37.50
3/18/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research re: minimum wage employment of DD individuals, court opinion, scholarly opinion	1.8	180.00
3/18/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Attention to correspondence, JMorgan, Review of Director's Correspondence, attention to file	0.7	70.00
3/18/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to OHHS docs, provided to US DOJ on 3/15/13	1	150.00
3/18/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mails from Attorney Morgan re TTP/FedCap	0.2	30.00
3/18/2013	Legal Services	WIC Tel. conf. with Attorney Jane Morgan re TTP status review, doc request review	0.4	60.00

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
4/3/2013	A 169

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

•

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
3/19/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Attention to correspondence, JMorgan, D Leyden, R Kline	0.3	30.00
3/19/2013	Legal Services	WIC Tel. conf. with Attorney Muksian of RIDE re doc. request, meeting, etc.	0.2	30.00
3/20/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attendance at conf. with OHHS representatives, RIDE representatives, US DOJ investigators and attorneys	3.2	480.00
3/23/2013	Legal Services	WIC Attn. to e-mails from Attorney Morgan and Attorney O'Gara	1.0	15.00
3/23/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mail from Attorney Muksian re US DOJ doc. request to RIDE	0.1	15.00
3/28/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research of DOJ position, attention to file, attention to discovery, research of correspondence and pertinent discovery and replies	1.5	150.00
3/29/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research of DOJ position, attention to file, attention to discovery, research of correspondence and pertinent discovery and replies	2	200.00

Total \$6,572.50

Payments/Credits \$0.00

Balance Due \$6,572.50

EXHIBIT F

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
5/1/2013	A 199

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
3/28/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Muksian status of doc.	0.2	30.00
		retrieval and compliance		
3/29/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mails from Attorney Morgan, Kline;	0.7	105.00
		attn. to docs. attached thereto re potential ct.		
		monitors; attn. to 3/29/13 correspondence from		
	}	Attorney Muksian of RIDE		:
4/1/2013	Legal Services		0.2	30.00
•	}	DOJ; correspondence from Attorney Muksian, RIDE		
		Attorney; response to DOJ request		
4/3/2013	Legal Services		0.4	60.00
		with Attorney Muksian/David Abbott's office		
4/4/2013	Legal Services		0.1	15.00
4/4/2013	Legal Services		0.1	15.00
		RIDE/Prov. School Dept. doc. production		
4/7/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research of Olmstead and CLI, preparation for	0.4	40.00
		analysis of tentative agreement; attention to file,		
		attention to correspondence		
4/9/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attendance at mtg with RIDE and Prov. School	1.3	195.00
		District reps. and attorneys		
4/9/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Muksian of RIDE and	1.25	187.50
		Attorney Carroll of the Prov. School Dept., US DOJ		
,		attorneys re preliminary findings and doc. request		
4/9/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with US DOJ attorneys re interim	0.3	45.00
		settlement agt.		
,				

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
5/1/2013	A 199

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
4/14/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mails from RIDE attorneys and Attorney Morgan	0.2	30.00
4/18/2013	Legal Services	, , ,	0.2	30.00
4/18/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to extensive e-mails with BHDDH/Birch School issues	0.3	45.00
4/22/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mails with Prov. School Dept. Attorney Mary Ann Carroll re doc. request/investigation status; tel. conf. with Attorney Carroll re same	0.3	45.00
4/22/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney J. Morgan re prep. for US DOJ tel. conf.	0.3	45.00
4/22/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research re: tentative interim agreement, Olmstead, comparable agreements, DOJ positioning on the matter	1.2	120.00
4/23/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to review of proposed draft interim agt.	0.7	105.00
4/23/2013		WJC Attendance at tel. conf. with BHDDH reps., RIDE reps., and Prov. School Dept.	1	150.00
4/23/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Attention to file, compliance with March 4 letter, document production, marshalling document requests per Attorney Mary Ann Carroll, RIDE.	0.3	30.00
4/23/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research re: tentative interim agreement, Olmstead, comparable agreements, DOJ positioning on the matter	0.5	50.00

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Page 2

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
5/1/2013	A 199

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
4/24/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mail correspondence from Attorney Morgan, Attorney Leyden, Dir. Stenning re proposed	0.5	75.00
		interim agt.		
4/24/2013	Legal Services	WJC Further review and attn. to proposed interim	1	150.00
		agt.	0.0	30.00
4/24/2013		WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney J. Morgan re same	0.2	
4/24/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Attention to file, compliance with March 4	0.8	80.00
		letter, document production, marshalling document		
		requests per Attorney Mary Ann Carroll, RIDE.		00.00
4/25/2013		WJC Tel. conf. with J. Kelley of OHHS legal dept.	0.2	30.00
4/25/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Attention to file, compliance with March 4	3.5	350.00
		letter, document production, marshalling document		
		requests per Attorney Mary Ann Carroll, RIDE.		
4/25/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research re: tentative interim agreement,	1.5	150.00
		Olmstead, comparable agreements, DOJ positioning		
		on the matter		
4/26/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Attention to file, compliance with March 4	0.3	30.00
		letter, document production, marshalling document	1	
		requests per Attorney Mary Ann Carroll, RIDE.	1	
4/26/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research re: tentative interim agreement,	3	300.00
		Olmstead, comparable agreements, DOJ positioning	į	
•		on the matter		
]	
			l	
			1	

Total \$2,567.50

Payments/Credits \$0.00

Balance Due \$2,567.50

EXHIBIT G

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

BILL TO State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
6/5/2013	A 230

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	
,	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
4/22/2013	Legal Services	AC Attn. to File - DOJ Monitors	0.8	120.00
4/28/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to TTP plan of correction; further review	3	450.00
		of Interim Agt. and scope issues/relevant statutory provisions		
4/29/2013	Legal Services	WIC Tel. conf. with Attorney Morgan & ORS reps.	1	150.00
4/29/2013	Legal Services		0.6	90.00
4/29/2013	Legal Services	l	0.25	37.50
4/30/2013	Legal Services	WJC Conf. with US DOJ attorneys, RIDE attorneys, BHDDH attorneys, Prov. School Dept. reps.	4,5	675.00
4/30/2013	Paralegal Ser		·2.7	270.00
5/1/2013	Paralegal Ser	of alternative settlement option	4.3	430.00
5/2/2013	Paralegal Ser	drafting alternative draft settlement option, analysis	6	600.00
	x 10	of alternative settlement option WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Padwa re Interim Agt.	0.4	60.00
5/3/2013	Legal Services		4.8	ľ
5/3/2013	Paralegal Ser	drafting alternative draft settlement option, analysis	7.0	100.00
5/6/2013	Legal Services	of alternative settlement option WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Carroll re Interim Agt. issue	0.1	15.00

To	otal
Pa	yments/Credits
B	alance Due

BILL TO

State of RI

150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

Department of Attorney General

REGARDING US Department of Justice Title II Investigation

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
6/5/2013	A 230

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
5/6/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to review of Agt. revisions from US DOJ & RIDE	1	150.00
5/6/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attendance at conf. call with US DOJ, BHDDH reps., ORS reps., RIDE reps., City of Prov. reps.	1	150.00
5/6/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Communications with the parties, marshalling documentation, drafting settlement agreements, research re: executive orders, letters of finding, monitor authority	5.3	530.00
5/7/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Communications with the parties, marshalling documentation, drafting settlement agreements, research re: executive orders, letters of finding, monitor authority	0.5	50.00
5/8/2013	Legal Services	l '	0.5	75.00
5/8/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Communications with the parties, marshalling documentation, drafting settlement agreements, research re: executive orders, letters of finding, monitor authority	2	200.00
5/9/2013	Paralegal Ser	ا معما ، ت ، ا	4.3	430.00
5/10/2013	Legal Services	1	0.5	75.00

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
6/5/2013	A 230

REGARDING	· · ·		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
US Department of Justice Title II Inve	estigation			
		 		
·				

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
5/10/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Communications with the parties, marshalling documentation, drafting settlement agreements, research re: executive orders, letters of finding, monitor authority	6.3	630.00
5/12/2013	Legal Services	WJC Review settlement agts., fact sheets with other states on similar enforcement actions	2	300.00
5/13/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research of comparable DOJ actions, analysis of potential MOU, research of comparable executive orders, research for out of court Olmstead Settlements, party communications	3.6	360.00
5/14/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to draft interim agt., mark-ups and revisions from RIDE, BHDDH, & US DOJ; tel. conf. & e-e-mails with J. Kelley, C. Stenning, D. Barclay, G. Muksian, & J. Morgan	0.8	120.00
5/14/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attendance at mtg at Gov.'s office with Chief Legal Counsel, C. Richards, Secretary of Office of Health & Human Services, C. Stenning & others	1.2	180.00
5/14/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research of comparable DOJ actions, analysis of potential MOU, research of comparable executive orders, research for out of court Olmstead Settlements, party communications	4	400.00
5/15/2013	Legal Services	AC Attn. to file - Review interim agreement	1.6	240.00

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.	
6/5/2013	A 230	

REGARDING	· ·
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	
•	

DATE	ПЕМ	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
5/15/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research of comparable DOJ actions, analysis of potential MOU, research of comparable executive orders, research for out of court Olmstead	6.5	650.00
5/16/2013	Paralegal Ser	Settlements, party communications DBC Research of comparable DOJ actions, analysis of potential MOU, research of comparable executive orders, research for out of court Olmstead	5.3	530.00
5/17/2013	Paralegal Ser	Settlements, party communications DBC Research of comparable DOJ actions, analysis of potential MOU, research of comparable executive orders, research for out of court Olmstead	- 1.5	150.00
5/20/2013 5/20/2013	Legal Services Legal Services	Settlements, party communications WJC Tel. conf. with J. Morgan WJC Attn. to revisions to interim agt. as to monitoring component; conf. call with Attorney	0.5 1	75.00 150.00
5/20/2013 5/21/2013	1 "	Carroll & Attorney Padwa re same AC Attn. to file DBC Research of Memorandum of Understanding, executive orders, comparisons of DOJ Cases with	0.2 5.5	30.00 550.00
5/22/2013 5/22/2013	Legal Services Legal Services	other states, research re: Olmstead law suits elsewhere, Research re: ADA Title II Damages WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Carroll WJC Tel. conf. with Attorneys & reps. of BHDDH & ORS	0.1 0.8	15.00 120.00

Total
Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

BILL TO State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.	
6/5/2013	A 230	

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	
•	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
5/22/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-e-mails from Attorney Morgan re Birch Graduates/transition issues	0.3	45.00
5/22/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research of Memorandum of Understanding, executive orders, comparisons of DOJ Cases with other states, research re: Olmstead law suits elsewhere, Research re: ADA Title II Damages	3.5	350.00
5/23/2013	Legal Services	WJC Conf. with Attorney Carroll	0.3	45.00
5/23/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Research of Memorandum of Understanding, executive orders, comparisons of DOJ Cases with other states, research re: Olmstead law suits elsewhere, Research re: ADA Title II Damages	2.5	250.00
5/24/2013	Legal Services		0.4	60.00
5/24/2013	Legal Services	1 '	1	150.00
5/24/2013	Paralegal Ser	, ,	4.7	470.00
5/27/2013	Paralegal Ser		4.6	460.00
5/28/2013	Paralegal Ser		5	500.00

Total
Payments/Credits
Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE DATE INVOICE NO.

DATE	INVOICE NO.	
6/5/2013	A 230	

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	· .

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
5/28/2013	Legal Services	AC Legal research re: FRCP 41; Attn. to file; Legal Research re: Title II damages	0.7	105.00
5/29/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Teleconference with the parties, research re: interim settlement agreement, Title II Dames	3.5	350.00
5/30/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Teleconference with the parties, research re: interim settlement agreement, Title II Dames	4.2	420.00
5/30/2013	Legal Services	AC Legal research re: FRCP 41; Attn. to file; Legal Research re: Title II damages	2.5	375.00
5/31/2013	Paralegal Ser	DBC Teleconference with the parties, research re: interim settlement agreement, Title II Dames	2.5	250.00
5/31/2013	Legal Services	AC Legal research re: FRCP 41; Attn. to file; Legal Research re: Title II damages	5.1	765.00
			3	

 Total
 \$14,132.50

 Payments/Credits
 \$0.00

 Balance Due
 \$14,132.50

EXHIBIT H

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

REGARDING US Department of Justice Title II Investigation

INVOICE

INVOICE NO.

A 259

DATE

7/3/2013

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
5/28/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Barclay of ORS re Interim Agt.	0.25	37.50
5/29/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with US DOJ attorneys re Interim	0.3	45.00
5/29/2013	Legal Services	Agt. WJC Conf. with Attorney Carroll of the City of Prov. re same; tel. conf. with Attorney Jerzyk re same	0.3	45.00
5/30/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to draft MOA; tel. conf. with Attorney Morgan re same; attn. to legal research re Rule 41	1.5	225.00
	-	procedures; attn. to legal research re US DOJ regs. re letters of findings; attn. to legal research re damages		
5/30/2013	Legal Services	under Title II	0.3	45.00
5/30/2013	Paralegal Ser	DD effective 2013 DBC Attention to format and content of potential MOUs, analysis of RI Agencies, comparison to other	0,5	50.00
5/31/2013	Legal Services	DOJ ISA's WJC Tel. conf. with J. Morgan re alt. settlement	0.3	45,00
5/31/2013	Legal Services		0.1	15.00
5/31/2013	Legal Services	Same WJC Tel. conf. with D. Sienko of RIDE; attn. to docs. from RIDE	0.3	45.00
5/31/2013	Legal Services		. 2	300.00

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
7/3/2013	A 259

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

		DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
DATE	ITEM		0.2	30.00
5/2/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mails, docs. from Attorney Morgan re DD/ORS roles, responsibilities, & transition; attn.		
5/2/2013	Legal Services	to docs. re same DBC Research re: FRCP Rule 41 Dismissals, DOJ practices re: LOFs and subsequent complaints, DOJ Olmstead case practices, State liabilities under an ISA, Comparison of Court Monitors vs. Third party	3.4	510.00
6/3/2013	Legal Services	1 1 11 A TANAMAN I APPOIL A LIGHT OF CHAMP A CONTRACT OF THE PROPERTY OF THE P	1	150.00
6/3/2013	Legal Services	INformant tel CONT. Williamon D. Zamana	1.5	225.00
6/3/2013	Legal Services	of neg., Rule 41 settlement procedures DBC Attention to Olmstead FRCP 41 Cases pursuant to third party intervenors and potential state liabilities	2.7	405.00
		under ADA Title II	3.4	1
6/3/2013 6/4/2013	Legal Service Legal Service	AC Attn to file - Research re: damages WJC Tel. conf. with US DOJ & state agency attorneys re status of settlement; conf. with state agency attorneys; attn. to drafting of agt.; tel. conf.	3.3	495.00
6/4/2013	Legal Service	with Attorney Muksian of RIDE DBC Teleconference with DOJ, attention to file	0.7	105.00
		Total	al	

BILL TO
State of RI

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

Providence, RI 02903

Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St.

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
7/3/2013	A 259

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
6/4/2013	Legal Services	DBC Drafting of ISA per discussion with DOJ; correspondence with parties; submission of State proposals to all parties	6.5	975.00
6/4/2013	Legal Services	DBC Review of ISA, attention to file, incorporation of FRCP 41	3.5	525.00
6/4/2013	Legal Services	AC Attn to file - Research re: damages	1.5	· 225.00
6/6/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Carroll re Interim Agt.	0.2	30.00
6/6/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with US DOJ attorneys, Attorney Morgan; tel. conf. with Attorney Carroll re Interim Agt.	0.8	120.00
6/7/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Carroll, Padwa, Ruggieri, Kline, Morgan	0.7	105.00
6/7/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf with Dir. Stenning & Attorney Morgan	0.2	30.00
6/7/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to LOF from US DOJ; tel. conf. with Attorney Morgan re monitor selection; attn. to revisions to agt. from Attorney Carroll at Prov. School Dept.	2.5	375.00
6/7/2013	Legal Services	DBC Teleconference with DOJ, correspondence with parties pursuant to teleconference, research repotentially contentious ISA Provisions	2.1	315,00
	1			

Total
Payments/Credits
Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.
7/3/2013	A 259

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of	
Justice Title II Investigation	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
6/9/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Morgan re revised agt. from Attorney Carroll; tel. conf. with Attorney Carroll re same; further attn. to revisions & attn. to research re schools/education role & employment of DD; attn. to Title 16 & relevant sections therein	4	600.00
6/9/2013	Legal Services	1 · · ·	2.5	375.00
6/10/2013	Legal Services		2.5	375.00
6/10/2013	Legal Services	DBC Negotiations with PPSD	4	600.00
6/10/2013	Legal Services	DBC Re-draft of ISA pursuant to negotiations with PPSD, correspondence with all parties, submission of proposal to DOJ	3.1	465.00
6/10/2013	Legal Services	^	1.5	225.00
6/10/2013	Legal Services	WJC Conf. with City of Prov. attorneys & reps.	3.5	525.00
6/10/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conferences with US Attorney Kline	0.3	45.00
6/11/2013	Legal Services	DBC Teleconference with DOJ re: ISA, filing of complaint	1.5	225.00

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

Page 4

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

REGARDING US Department of Justice Title II Investigation

INVOICE

INVOICE NO.

A 259

DATE

7/3/2013

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
6/11/2013	Legal Services	DBC Attention to documentation provided by DOJ pursuant to complaint filing, FRCP 41 joint dismissal	1.7	255.00
6/11/2013	Legal Services	DBC Attention to media, attention to press releases, correspondence amongst parties pursuant to filing in federal court, coordination with PPSD, DOJ, ORS, DHS, RIDE pursuant to signatories	3	450.00
6/11/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attn. to pleadings (Rule 41) & DOJ revisions to agt.	0.7	105.00
6/11/2013 6/11/2013		WJC Tel. conferences with US DOJ & City of Prov. WJC Tel. conferences with Attorney Morgan, Dir. Stenning, J. Kelley (OHHS), Attorney Richards (Gov. Office), Attorney Muksian (RIDE), US Attorney Kline, Attorney Carroll (Prov.); attn. to e-mails from	0.75 4	112.50 600.00
		D. Barclay (DHS) re docs. procedures, etc.; attn. to docs. related thereto		
6/11/2013	Legal Services	AC Research re: Rule 41	2.1	315.00
6/12/2013		DBC Meeting with BHDDH pursuant to Director Stening's Signing of the ISA	0.8	120.00
6/12/2013	Legal Services	DBC Meeting with ORS pursuant to Director Powell's Signing of the ISA	0.7	105.00
6/12/2013	Legal Services	DBC Meeting with DHS pursuant to Secretary Constantino's Signing of the ISA	0.7	105.00
6/12/2013	Legal Services	DBC Meeting with RIDE pursuant to Commissioner Gist's Signing of the ISA	1.3	195.00
6/12/2013	Legal Services	DBC Meeting with DOJ to present signed ISA	0.7	105.00

Total		
Payments/Credits	•	
Balance Due		

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.	
7/3/2013	A 259	

BILL TO	
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	

6/12/2013 Leg	egal Services	DBC Attention to Correspondence with DOJ and amongst parties pursuant to signatories of ISA; coordination with DOJ and PPSD pursuant to merging ISA signatories WJC Attn. to revised docs. & revised Interim Settlement Agt.	2.3	345.00 75.00
		merging ISA signatories WJC Attn. to revised docs. & revised Interim	0.5	75.00
6/12/2013		Settlement Agt.		75.00
1.Cg		WJC Tel. conferences with US Attorney Kline, Attorney Richards, Attorney Morgan, Attorney	0.8	120.00
6/12/2013 Leg	gal Services	Barclay; attn. to final reviews to docs. WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Morgan, Dir. Stenning; conf. with US Attorney Kline	0.5	75.00
6/13/2013 Leg	egal Services	DBC Attention to Filing of Complaint, attendance at Press Conference, communication amongst parties	3.5	525.00
	1	pursuant to Press Conference, Analysis of Press Releases, review of court filings, marshalling documentation pursuant to court filings		
6/13/2013 Leg	gal Services	DBC Attention to file, communication history with RIDE, document production to all parties, e-mail to David Sienko, attention to e-mail from David Abbot, e-mail correspondence with David Abbot	2.7	405.00
6/13/2013 Leg	gal Services	WJC Attn. to e-mails with Dir. Stenning, Attorney Morgan, Richards; tel. conf. with Attorney Morgan	0.3	45.00
6/13/2013 Leg	gal Services	WIC Attendance at Federal Ct. re filing of Complaint, review Complaint with US Attorney Kline	1.25	187.50

Page 6

	Total
,	Payments/Credits
	Balance Due

Attorney at Law 670 Willett Avenue East Providence, RI 02915 (401) 437-0905

INVOICE

DATE	INVOICE NO.	
7/3/2013	A 259	

BILL TO	-
State of RI Department of Attorney General 150 South Main St. Providence, RI 02903	

REGARDING	
US Department of Justice Title II Investigation	

DATE	ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY/HRS.	AMOUNT
6/13/2013	Legal Services		1.25	187.50
6/17/2013	Legal Services	DBC Client Correspondence	0.3	45.00
6/21/2013	Legal Services	DBC Attention to file, correspondence with the	5.2	780.00
6/09/0012	T 1 G 1 · ·	Monitor, review of ISA pursuant to Due Dates		
6/28/2013	Legal Services	WJC Tel. conf. with Attorney Morgan re monitor status & related issues	0.1	15.00
6/28/2013	Legal Services	WJC Attendance at mtg. with ORS, BHDDH, RIDE, Gov. Chief Legal Counsel	1	150.00
6/28/2013	Legal Services		0.4	60.00
		bos, tot. com. with Attorney Morgan		
		•		
	}			
		·		
				1

Page 7

 Total
 \$14,900.00

 Payments/Credits
 \$0.00

 Balance Due
 \$14,900.00